
PRAYER TOPICS for week beginning 17/01/22

On Wednesday at Fresh Streams for an hour before the final session there is an opportunity to go 
into the main hall, sit and think or just be with God, whilst background music is playing. I took that 
opportunity and as I sat I began to write in my phone.
I would love to share with you what the result was. I think that there is a lot here that we could do 
some serious prayer about. Forgive me if you think that what is written is an over generalisation, 
but I genuinely was not aware of what I was writing and it just flowed onto the screen.

Repent

The Church in general needs to repent of all it's petty squabbles over insignificant things.  Forgive 
us that we do not preach Christ crucified, or acknowledge the Power of the Holy Spirit, or believe in
Jesus' birth, death and resurrection.

My Fellowship needs to repent. Do we do what God wants us to do?  Do we seek his face as we 
should? Do we get on our knees or bow before his throne?  Do we just talk at him. DO WE EVER 
LISTEN?  

Then me, what do I need to repent of the personal things no one else knows about.  The dark 
recesses of my heart which need clearing out.  Jesus I am sorry for it all. Holy Spirit start with me, 
fill me afresh and take me back to the place of my first love.

Jesus, we are sorry as a Fellowship. We do not worship you as we should nor draw close to you as 
we should. Forgive us, let your Holy Spirit shake us, break us, then mould us and make us into the 
Fellowship you want us to be.   Give us listening ears that we might hear you speaking clearly, so 
we may go where you send us, speak to those you put in our path , be bold in your Spirit, be united 
in all that we do so that your light might be so blinding in our community, that those who do not 
know you cannot help but notice and want to know more.

Jesus, we are sorry as your Bride, we are not ready. Lead us back to the beginning.  As Church may 
we put you back in your rightful place. King of Kings, Lord of Lords, Emmanuel.  Let us not shirk  
our responsibilities to the World.  Let your voice be heard in the Nations.  Jesus, the Light of the 
World, the only hope for the future.  One day, every knee will bow before the Throne.  

Jesus, we love you, we adore you, we bow before you, we acknowledge you as King and Lord of 
all.


