
We Entrusted Our Loved One To The Golden Care Of: 

Golden Gate Funeral & Cremation Services, LLC 
2800 East 18th Street ~ Kansas City, MO 64127  

(816) 255-3676 
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The family of Wendell N. Todd wishes to acknowledge, with deep gratitude 

and appreciation, the thoughtfulness, love, generosity and concern extended 

to them during the loss of their loved one.  May God continually protect and 

bless you.  

We’ll See This Through  

They say this, too, shall pass,  

They say grief eventually fades.  

But those sayings are of little comfort  

When you’re living through such sad days.  

They say that time heals all,  

And this mush I know is true.  

So hang in there, my dearest friend,  

And together we’ll see this through!  

                     Honorary Pallbearers 

 Thaddeus Todd             Chris Slaughter       

Craig Slaughter             Corey Slaughter 

Jamison Memorial Temple CME Church 

3115 Linwood Blvd, Kansas City, Missouri 64127 

Saturday, November 18, 2023 ~ 1:00 p.m.  

Harold G. Todd,  Officiating 

Fair winds and following seas, may forever you feel, upon your 
cheek, the salty breeze. Your spirit lives on in many a heart, 
your words captured, and never to depart.  May your loved 

ones have the comfort in knowing, to heaven is where you are 
going.  For all that they have to do is look above, and they will 

be reminded of your love.  



 Celebration Order           Reflections Of His 

 Wendell Neil Todd July 27, 1957 - November 1, 2023  

Wendell Neil Todd was born in Kansas City, MO, Saturday, July 
27, 1957 to Alvin and Constance Todd.  

He was the third of four sons. He was a lively child and brought  
excitement to the family. The family, at the time, attended 
Jamison Memorial Temple CME Church, though it is not certain 
when Wendell accepted Christ as his personal Savior. Wendell 
attended schools in the Kansas City area and graduated from 
Paseo High School in 1975, where he was a standout player in 
basketball. He later played for UMKC in KCMO.  

He was fond of traveling and drove for several national and local 
trucking companies over the years. He was adept at driving and 
repairing the “Big Rigs.” Brother Todd was blessed with a 
daughter in 1975. He was married to Bridgette Williams in 1991, 
and joined the Navy that same year, where he worked on aviation 
support equipment and was a member of the “Commissioning 
Crew” for the USS Boxer (LHD 4) in February 1995. Wendell’s 
life was ladened with challenges. He was an active and a                   
personable individual. He loved his daughter, and grands, and 
doted a bit on them all. He was truly fond of the “Lone Star 
State,” and spent much time remembering times spent there. He 
was especially fond of his memories of Houston county. He loved 
his naval experiences and commented on how different the               
military was from civilian life. Mom and dad impacted his life in 
many ways. He routinely spoke of things daddy had said and how 
these statements played out in life.  

Wendell was an interesting individual, to say the least, and will 
be missed by many Wendell was preceded in death by his father; 
Alvin Todd, his mother; Constance Woods Todd, and older 
brother; Dennis Todd. 

  Procession                            Family and Clergy 

  

  Hymn of Praise          

 

  Scripture                                       

        Old Testament                   2 Proverbs 4:5-10 

        New Testament                 1 Thessalonians 5:1-11 

 

Prayer  

 

Song of Celebration                   Venus “Mikki” Todd 

 

Tributes                                                              Friend 

                                                                     Classmate 

                                                                        Family 

  Condolences                    

 

Song of Celebration                                  

  

Words Of Comfort               Minister Harold G. Todd 

Recessional             


